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How can I find God?
If you are seeking for reality you can find
it at the foot of the Cross. When you cry
to God with all your heart; and you will
be as conscious of your relationship with
God as anything in this old world. You
have an existence, and you know it. You
can equally know God and His salvation.

You can know Jesus as your Saviour. You
can surrender your heart and soul to God,
and say, “Lord, I give my heart and soul
to Thee, and turn my back upon sin.”
Jesus said “You cannot serve God and
mammon; so if you are going to enter the
service of Jesus Christ, you must say
good-bye to the world. And you will be
glad to do it when you are tired of sin.
Like many of us, you find this old world is
a shallow place to live in, without the
hope of the Gospel of Jesus Christ.

Thank God, there is a way out of sin. Will
you give your live to Him? Let one eternal
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YES well up out of the deepest recesses of
your soul, until you say, “Lord, I
surrender all – I come believing Your
promises.”

It is believe that brings us in contact with
God. It isn’t our intellect. The man who
had been blind met Jesus, and Jesus said,
“Dost thou believe on the Son of God?”
He said, “Who is He, Lord, that I might
believe on Him?” Jesus said, “Thou hast
both seen Him, and it is He that talketh
with thee.” And he said, “Lord, I believe.”
And he worshiped Him. The man was
saved in the moment that he said, “Lord,
I believe.” And you will have the same
experience the moment you believe. You
will know Jesus in the pardon of your sins,
and peace and joy unspeakable will be
yours.


